Philipp, Janna

From: Flanigan, Carrie A.

Sent: Tuesday, May 14, 2019 11:01 AM
To: Philipp, Janna; Patterson, Sarah
Subject: FW: LCCAC Grant

From: Hyman, Lindsay <Lindsay.M.Hyman@illinois.gov>
Sent: Tuesday, May 14, 2019 10:58 AM

To: Flanigan, Carrie A. <CFlanigan@lakecountyil.gov>
Subject: RE: LCCAC Grant

Carrie,

The contract for FY20 has a current budget amount of $80,380.

From: Flanigan, Carrie A. [mailto:CFlanigan@lakecountyil.gov]
Sent: Tuesday, May 14, 2019 10:39 AM

To: Hyman, Lindsay <Lindsay.M.Hyman@illinois.gov>
Subject: [External] LCCAC Grant

Lindsay-

| wanted to touch base and see if you were aware of what our award would be this year- We are in the process of
completing our VOCA grant and | do not want to guess on the dollar value that we receive with DCFS- is this something
you know at this point ?

Carrie Flanigow

Lake County State’s Attorney’y Office/

Lake County Childrew's Advocacy Center~Executive Divector
123 N. O’Plavine Road

Gurnee, Ilinoisy 60031

847-377-3000
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