
 Bid #21004 BID TAB Bidder #1 Bidder #2 Bidder #3

Rollins / Wilson Juction Chamber Rehabilitation Prepareed: 2/2/2021

LCPW Project #2014.098
GHA EOPC

Bid Item. # DESCRIPTION UNIT QUANTITY UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

GENERAL REQUIREMENTS
1 Mobilization / Project Administration / Demobilization LS 1 40,000$                   8,625.00 34,027.50 70,000.00

2 Pre-construction Video / Project Photograph Log LS 1 6,500$                     1,000.00 460.00 10,500.00

3 Temporary Facilities LS 1 1,500$                     1,875.00 2,445.00 3,900.00

SOIL EROSION CONTROL / PRE-CONSTRUCTION PREPARATION
4 Silt Fence LF 200 5$                       1,000$                     8$                       1,600.00 5.00 1,000.00 10$                     2,000.00

5 Inlet Baskets EA 3 250$                   750$                        161$                   483.00 250.00 750.00 315$                   945.00

6 Ditch Checks EA 3 750$                   2,250$                     298$                   894.00 250.00 750.00 400$                   1,200.00

7 Tree Trunk Protection, Root Pruning, and Trimming LS 1 3,500$                     3,000.00 500.00 3,500.00

8 Sediment Containment Filter Bag LS 1 2,000$                     247.00 350.00 550.00

9 Erosion Control Maintenance & Removal LS 1 3,500$                     1,438.00 940.00 2,500.00

CONSTRUCTION PREPARATION
10 Traffic Control and Protection - General LS 1 25,000$                   1.00 5.00 9,000.00

11 Traffic Control Rollins and Wilson Intersection LS 1 125,000$                  24,255.00 24,255.00 46,000.00

12 Traffic Control Truck Detour Route LS 1 12,500$                   2,415.00 2,415.00 7,500.00

13 Maintenance of Existing Traffic Signal Installation EA 1 5,000$                5,000$                     2,772$                2,772.00 2,772.00 2,772.00 2,640$                2,640.00

14 Modify Existing Controller EA 2 2,500$                5,000$                     2,101$                4,202.00 2,101.05 4,202.10 2,001$                4,002.00

15 Temporary Video Detection EA 1 20,000$              20,000$                   13,813$              13,813.00 13,812.75 13,812.75 13,155$              13,155.00

16A Temporary Traffic Signal Timing EA 1 5,000$                5,000$                       10 to 16B 1,040$                1,040.00   10 to 16B 1,039.50 1,039.50   10 to 16B 990$                   990.00   10 to 16B

16B Temporary Emergency EVP Equipment LS 1 5,000$                     202,500$      4,897.00 53,395$       4,897.20 53,399$       4,664.00 87,951$       
17 Temporary Construction Fencing LS 1 5,000$                     3,609.00 1,840.00 6,000.00

18 Sewer Bypass LS 1 25,000$                   19,188.00 24,525.00 64,000.00

DROP CHAMBER REHABILITATION
19 Flat Top Removal and Drop Chamber Measurements LS 1 20,000$                   10,681.00 10,954.00 18,000.00

20 Extension of Vertical Walls LS 1 12,500$                   17,938.00 9,975.00 18,000.00

21 Rebuild Bench - Chamber LS 1 7,500$                     9,806.00 5,055.00 14,000.00

22 Stainless Steel Trough Installation LS 1 22,500$                   39,181.00 18,484.25 15,200.00

23 Internal Drop Construction - Chamber LS 1 15,000$                   16,816.00 13,544.80 34,000.00

24 Flat Top Replacement and Associated Castings - Chamber LS 1 12,500$                   20,025.00 7,667.73 17,500.00

25 Drop Chamber Lining                                                                             BID THIS ITEM or ALT C LS 1 -$                             80,000 0.00 No Bid 0.00 70,700.01 0.00 64,767.00

DROP BOX REHABILITATION
26 Flat Top Removal and Drop Box Measurements LS 1 15,000$                   10,681.00 5,903.50 7,000.00

27 Rebuild Bench - Box LS 1 7,500$                     8,556.00 7,845.00 9,500.00

28 Internal Drop Construction - Box LS 1 15,000$                   18,183.00 16,470.40 36,000.00

29 Flat Top Replacement and Associated Castings - Box LS 1 12,500$                   16,300.00 7,946.48 14,250.00

30 Drop Box Lining                                                                                   BID THIS ITEM or (ATL A or B) LS 1 -$                             65,000 0.00 No Bid 0.00 63,360.23 0.00 57,866.00

RESTORATION / WARRANTY
31 Televising Drop Box and Drop Chamber After Product Application LS 1 5,000$                     1,500.00 5,674.27 5,509.00

32 Televising Drop Box and Drop Chamber At End of One-Year Warranty LS 1 5,000$                     1,500.00 5,674.27 9,165.28

33 1-Year Warranty and Maintenance Bond LS 1 9,000$                     7,500.00 824.00 3,085.18

34 Flowable Fill at Drop Chamber LS 1 5,000$                     2,191.00 4,275.00 15,000.00

35 Pavement Restoration Class D Patch (2" Surface / 10" Binder / 12" CA-6 Base) LS 1 7,500$                     11,661.00 10,175.00 15,000.00

36 Aggregate Shoulder Restoration (CA-6) LS 1 1,000$                     784.00 1,010.00 4,000.00

37 Preparation of Disturbed Lawn Area and Placement of Topsoil LS 1 12,500$                   3,609.00 2,880.00 12,000.00

38 Seed / Fertilize / Erosion Blanket Over Disturbed Lawn Areas LS 1 7,500$                     3,484.00 1,910.00 10,000.00

ALTERNATE PRICING UNIT QUANTITY UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
A Drop Box Lining - Armorock LS 1 125,000 0.00 No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 No Bid
B Drop Box Lining - Geospray AMS                                                  BID THIS ALT or ITEM #30 LS 1 65,000$                   30,106.00 55,502.58 53,886.00

C Drop Chamber Lining - Geospray AMS                                         BID THIS ALT or ITEM #25  LS 1 80,000$                   39,617.00 59,021.06 57,302.00

BID AMOUNT With ALT B + C 631,000.00 With ALT B + C 365,473.00 With ALT B + C 371,778.39 With ALT B + C 621,443.46

Updated: 2/9/21 Items 1 to 38 631,000.00 Items 1 to 38 No Bid Items 1 to 38 391,314.99 Items 1 to 38 632,888.46

Bid as Read 365,473.00 506,333.63 632,663.46

Addendum Acknowledgement #1 #1 #1

Qualification Form Yes Yes Yes

Vender Disclosure Yes Yes Yes

Resonsible Bidder Affidavit Yes Yes Yes

Vender Ceetification Form Yes Yes Yes

10% bid Bond Yes Yes Yes
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Archon Campanella Berger
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