LAKE COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS

BID TAB
BID# 13208
Project: Lagoon #1 Bio-solids Removal
Round Lake Sanitary District Excess Flow Improvements
LCPW # 2012.054 ENGINEER's Synagro Central Stewart Spreading Wealing Walter and Son
Estimate of Cost Brothers LLC Waste Hauling
ITEM# |DESCRIPTION Unit | Quantity | Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
LA MOBILIZATION AND DEMOBILIZATION LS 1 10,000 $10,000.00 20,486 $20,486.00 5,000 $5,000.00 5,000 $5,000.00 20,000 $20,000.00
2 A LAGOON DEWATERING LS 1 15,000 $15,000.00 19,115 $19,115.00 8,500 $8,500.00 15,000 $15,000.00 18,000 $18,000.00
3A LIQUID BIOSOLIDS REMOVAL & DISPOSAL Gallon | 3,000,000 0.18 $540,000.00 0.0986 $295,800.00 0.1074 $322,200.00 0.1183 $355,000.00 0.17 $510,000.00
4p  |STABILIZED CONSTUCTION TRUCK TURN AROUND LS 1 4,000 $4,000.00 9,600 $9,500.00 18,500 $18,500.00 15,000 $15,000.00 6,000 $6,000.00
5A DUST CONTROL WATERING Units 20 150 $3,000.00 155 $3,100.00 150 $3,000.00 250 $5,000.00 100 $2,000.00
BA MECHANICAL STREET SWEEPING AND CLEANING Hr 40 170 $6,800.00 209 $8,360.00 150 $6,000.00 125 $5,000.00 200 $8,000.00
CONTRACT ALLOWANCE - SUNSET DRIVE & HART ROAD
7A POST CONSTRUCTION PAVEMENT SPOT REPAIR AND PATCHING LS 1 25,000 $25,000.00 25,000 $25,000.00 25,000 $25,000.00 25,000 $25,000.00 25,000 $25,000.00
8A  |PRECONSTRUCTION VIDEO LS 1 3,000 $3,000.00 1,620 $1,620.00 1,500 $1,500.00 100 $100.00 1,500 $1,5600.00
9A  |CONTRACT ALLOWANCE - ODOR CONTROL APPLICATION LS 1 6,000 $6,000.00 6,000 $6,000.00 6,000 $6,000.00 6,000 $6,000.00 6,000 $6,000.00
TOTAL BASEBID A § $612,800.00 $388,981.00 $395,700.00 $431,100.00 $596,500.00
Bid As Read 8/5/13 $612,800.00 $388,981.00 $395,700.00 $425,100.00 $596,500.00
TOTAL BASEBID B $ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ALTERNATE UNIT PRICE BID ITEM
ITEM NO.|DESCRIPTION
1 BIOSOLIDS REMOVAL & TRANSPORT TO OWNER'S
NCT TREATMENT PLANT PER GALLON 0.14 PER GALLON 0.0563 PER GALLON 0.1611 PER GALLON 0.08 PER GALLON 0.17

ENGINEER's
Estimate of Cost

Synagro Central

Stewart Spreading

C:\Documents and Settings\PW15871\Desktop\BID TAB #13208 Bio-solids Removal 8-6-13.xIsx

Wealing
Brothers LLC

Walter and Son
Waste Hauling

10f2



