
Bid #21005 BID TAB Bidder #1 Bidder #2

ROLLINS / WISON 42" TRANSMISSION SEWER LINING 2/2/2021

LCPW Project #2014.098
GHA EOPC

Bid Item. # DESCRIPTION UNIT QUANTITY UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

GENERAL REQUIREMENTS

1 Mobilization / Project Administration / Demobilization LS 1 20,000.00 15,000.00 105,000.00

2 Pre-Construction Video LS 1 5,000.00 65,000.00 5,000.00

3 Temporary Facilities LS 1 500.00 2,850.00 3,700.00

4 Erosion Control Installation, Maintenance and Removal LS 1 2,500.00 100.00 8,000.00

CONSTRUCTION PREPARATION

5 Traffic Control and Protection LS 1 30,000.00 30,200.00 36,000.00

6 Temporary Construction Fencing LS 1 5,000.00 1,500.00 9,500.00

7 Sewer Bypass for Lining 42" Sewer from MH 72BB01 to Blind 90 Bend at Drop Chamber 72AA29 LS 1 25,000.00 13,500.00 45,000.00

8 Sewer Bypass for Lining 42" Sewer from MH72AA28 to Blind 90 at Drop Chamber 72AA29 LS 1 10,000.00 13,500.00 45,000.00

SEWER LINING

9 Blind 90 Bend Lining - Geospray AMS                                BID THIS ITEM or ALT A and (ALT D or E) LS 1 12,500.00 30,000.00 25,000.00

10 42" Transmission Sewer Lining - Geospray AMS                        BID THIS ITEM or ALT B or C LF 820 250.00 205,000.00 177.20 145,304.00 265.00 217,300.00

11 Filling Pipe Joints Prior to Lining EA 105 250.00 26,250.00 326.00 34,230.00 880.00 92,400.00

12 Cleaning and Prepping Exposed Steel Reinforcement and Steel Wire LS 1 7,500.00 7,000.00 10,000.00

RESTORATION / WARRANTY

13 Topsil / Seed Blanket all Distribed Lawn Areas LS 1 10,000.00 100.00 15,000.00

14 Televising 42" Sewer After Product Application LS 1 3,500.00 5,350.00 3,000.00

15 Televising / Still Color Photos of Blind 90 Degree Bend After Product Application LS 1 500.00 550.00 1,800.00

16 1-Year Warranty and Maintenance Bond LS 1 4,500.00 1,000.00 15,000.00

17 Televising 42" Sewer at End of One-year Warranty Period LS 1 3,500.00 5,350.00 27,000.00

18 Televising / Still Color Photos of Blind 90 Degree Bend at end of One-year Warranty Period LS 1 500.00 550.00 4,000.00

BID AMOUNT     ITEMS 1 to 18 371,750.00 371,084.00 667,700.00

ALTERNATE PRICING UNIT QUANTITY UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

A+ A+ A Sewer and Blind 90 Bend Structural Rehabilitation Prior to Topcoat Lining System LS 1 25,000.00

B B 42" Transmission Sewer Lining - Epoxy                                 BID THIS ALT or ITEM #9 or ALT C LF 820 188,600.00 0.00 No Bid 0.00 No Bid

or C C 42" Transmission Sewer Lining - Polyurea                            BID THIS ALT or ITEM #9 or ALT B LF 820 188,600.00 0.00 No Bid 0.00 No Bid

D D Bling 90 Degree Bend Lining - Epoxy LS 1 0.00 No Bid No Bid

or E E Bling 90 Degree Bend Lining - Polyurea LS 1 0.00 No Bid No Bid

BID AMOUNT  WITH ALTERNATES N/A N/A N/A

Updated: 2/9/21 GHA EOPC

Note: Both bidders only submitted based on bid Itgems 1 to 18 and did not bid any of the alternate pricing Bid as Read 371,084.00 667,700.00

Addendum Acknowledgement #1 to #4 #1 to #4

Qualification Form Yes Yes

Vender Disclosure Yes Yes

Resonsible Bidder Affidavit Yes Yes

Vender Certification Form Yes Yes

10% bid Bond Yes Yes

Insituform

Insituform Berger

Berger
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